
CONTROL LOWEST EXTENDED LOWEST ROVIC GRAINGER SUBURBAN MONITOR ALLSTON SUPPLY BENMAN NE MAINTENANCE OM WORKSPACE

AP 14 E114 MICROWAVE OVEN $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 2 E132 REFRIGERATOR - SMALL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 1 E133 ICE MACHINE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 9 E134 REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 6 E135 RANGE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 1 E136 REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER/ICE MAKER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 1 E139 REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER - 25 CU. FT. $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 1 E140 CHEST FREEZER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 1 E141 COOKING TOP $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 1 LA 01 WASHER/DRYER - STACKABLE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 2 LA 02 WASHER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

AP 2 LA 03 DRYER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-02 CLAY EXTRUDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-03 CLAY PUGMILL AND CART $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-03-1 CLAY PUGMILL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-03-2 CART - PUGMILL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-05 CLAY SLABROLLER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 2 ART-06 DRYING RACK $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 2 ART-08 KILN W/ UNDERMOUNTED VENT $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 7 ART-09 POTTERY WHEEL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-10 SPRAY BOOTH $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-10-1 SPRAY BOOTH W/VENTING DUCTS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-10-2 SPRAY BOOTH STAND $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-12 WEDGING TABLE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-13 CART - WARE CART $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 13 ART-13-1 CART - WARE CART SHELVES $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 ART-14 VACUUM $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 3 ART-16 PAPER CUTTER AND CART $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 3 ART-16-1 CART - PAPER CUTTER $724.00 $724.00 $2,172.00 $891.69 $724.00

ART 2 ART-17 PORTABLE TAC BOARD $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 2 ART-19 ART SAFETY CABINET $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 12 ART-20 DISPLAY HANGERS - PAINTINGS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 3 PC-01 PAPER CUTTER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

ART 1 PC-02 PAPER CUTTER $0.00 NO BID $0.00
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CUST 1 FA-03 ROLL GROOVER $594.75 $594.75 $594.75 $594.75

CUST 1 FA-16 SCRUBBER - 28" RIDER $11,692.00 $11,692.00 $11,692.00 $12,620.00 $11,692.00 $14,400.00

CUST 1 FA-17 SCRUBBER - 26" WALK BEHIND $7,664.00 $7,664.00 $7,664.00 $8,750.00 $7,664.00 $8,400.00

CUST 2 FA-18 BURNISHER - 20" ELECTRIC $1,660.00 $1,660.00 $3,320.00 $2,080.00 $1,660.00 $1,700.00

CUST 1 FA-19 BURNISHER - BATTERY POWERED $4,722.00 $4,722.00 $4,722.00 $4,722.00 $5,382.00 $5,900.00

CUST 2 FA-20 FLR MACHINE - 20" $859.00 $859.00 $1,718.00 $1,094.00 $859.00 $1,300.00

CUST 6 FA-21 VACUUM - BACK-PACK $325.00 $325.00 $1,950.00 $325.00 $359.00 $400.00

CUST 1 FA-22 EXTRACTOR - ELECTRIC $2,462.00 $2,462.00 $2,462.00 $3,112.00 $2,462.00 $2,900.00

CUST 1 FA-23 EXTRACTOR - BATTERY RIDER $12,028.00 $12,028.00 $12,028.00 $12,747.00 $12,028.00 $13,000.00

CUST 1 FA-24 EXTRACTOR /SPOTTER $476.00 $476.00 $476.00 $490.00 $476.00 $640.00

CUST 3 FA-25 RETRIEVER $598.00 $598.00 $1,794.00 $2,180.00 $598.00

CUST 3 FA-26 CARPET DRYER $199.00 $199.00 $597.00 $220.00 $290.00 $199.00 $275.00

CUST 8 FA-27 MOP BUCKET/ WRINGER $54.88 $54.88 $439.04 $54.88 $58.96 $57.64

CUST 8 FA-28 MOP BUCKET/ WRINGER (COMPACT) $40.10 $40.10 $320.80 $63.00 $89.41 $40.10

CUST 12 FA-29 GARBAGE CAN - 32 GAL. $29.32 $29.32 $351.84 $29.32 $35.50 $34.41 $31.25

CUST 6 FA-30 RECYCLE CONTAINER $22.91 $22.91 $137.46 $22.91 $28.00 $24.60 $24.64

CUST 6 FA-31 DOLLY - 20-55 GAL. CAP. $102.91 $102.91 $617.46 $102.91 $120.00 $110.63 $107.20

CUST 6 FA-34 CUBE TRUCK $253.17 $253.17 $1,519.02 $273.00 $253.17 $292.45 $280.80

CUST 3 GA-01 GARBAGE CAN - 20 GAL. W/ DOLLIE $17.80 $17.80 $53.40 $17.80 $19.50 $19.10 $19.36

CUST 3 GA-01-1 GARBAGE CAN - 20 GAL. DOLLIE $48.84 $48.84 $146.52 $48.84 $64.00 $52.46 $51.40

CUST 30 GA-02 GARBAGE CAN - 55 GAL. W/ DOLLIE $54.07 $54.07 $1,622.10 $54.07 $63.00 $58.00 $56.80

CUST 30 GA-02-1 GARBAGE CAN - 55 GAL. DOLLIE $48.84 $48.84 $1,465.20 $48.84 $64.00 $52.46 $51.40

CUST 3 GA-03 GARBAGE CAN - BIOHAZARD $55.00 $55.00 $165.00 $55.00

CUST 130 GA-05 GARBAGE CAN - SM "WE RECYCLE" $3.95 $3.95 $513.50 $3.95 $4.75 $4.21 $5.20

CUST 19 GA-06 GARBAGE CAN - MED "WE RECYCLE" $4.42 $4.42 $83.98 $4.42 $5.25 $4.60 $5.56

CUST 4 GA-07 GARBAGE CAN - LG. "WE RECYCLE" $33.26 $33.26 $133.04 $33.26 $39.50 $37.54 $35.32

CUST 21 GA-08 GARBAGE CAN - HALLWAY $198.00 $198.00 $4,158.00 $234.79 $198.00 $272.20

   

DISP 1 DS-03 DISPLAY - STORE DISPLAY COUNTER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 1 DS-04 DISPLAY - TOWER CASE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 1 DS-05 DISPLAY - CLOTHING RACK $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 2 DS-06 DISPLAY - SIGN HOLDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 1 DS-07 DISPLAY - COUNTER CAP RACK $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 1 DS-08 DISPLAY - ELECTRIC SIGN $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 1 DS-09 DISPLAY - MANNEQUIN $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 8 LB-04 TOWER BOOK DISPLAY $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 7 LIT-01 LITERATURE DISPLAY $0.00 NO BID $0.00

DISP 1 RK-02 CLOTHING RACK $0.00 NO BID $0.00
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FURN 3 CB-01-2 CABINET - OVER COUNTER $181.00 $181.00 $543.00 $181.00 $235.56 $185.00

FURN 1 CB-08 CABINET - REFRESHMENT CENTER $198.00 $198.00 $198.00 $344.00 $436.40 $198.00

FURN 1 CH-27 GLIDER CHAIR $0.00 NO BID $0.00

FURN 4 COT-01 COT $825.00 $825.00 $3,300.00 $825.00

FURN 1 CT-01 COUNTER -  BOTTOM 2 DR. CAB. $0.00 NO BID $0.00

FURN 9 CU-02 WALL MOUNTED SHELVING $0.00 NO BID $0.00

FURN 10 F-08 FILE CABINET - VERT. FIREPRF 4DR $1,319.00 $1,319.00 $13,190.00 $1,319.00 $1,908.00

FURN 2 LK-01 LOCKER $553.00 $553.00 $1,106.00 $553.00 $570.00

FURN 4 LK-02 LOCKER $209.00 $209.00 $836.00 $209.00 $277.00

FURN 1 MIR-01 MIRROR - 3-WAY FLOOR $0.00 NO BID $0.00

FURN 6 MIR-02 MIRROR - FULL LENGTH MIRROR $265.00 $265.00 $1,590.00 $265.00

FURN 1 NU-01 SCALE $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00

FURN 1 NU-02 NARCOTICS CABINET $94.00 $94.00 $94.00 $94.00

FURN 2 PO-01 PODIUM $1,134.00 $1,134.00 $2,268.00 $1,134.00

FURN 40 ST-06 STOOL - TECH. ED. STUDENT $55.00 $55.00 $2,200.00 $55.00 $105.61 $114.00

FURN 3 ST-10 STOOL - FOOT STOOL $43.00 $43.00 $129.00 $43.00

FURN 1 T-10 TABLE - EXAM $2,085.00 $2,085.00 $2,085.00 $2,085.00

FURN 1 T-18A TABLE - ADA SCIENCE BLK TOP $0.00 NO BID $0.00

FURN 2 T-20 TABLE - TRAINER'S TAPING $0.00 NO BID $0.00

FURN 2 DS-01 DISPLAY CASE $557.00 $557.00 $1,114.00 $557.00 $628.60 $647.00

FURN 3 DS-02 DISPLAY CASE - TROPHIES $1,055.00 $1,055.00 $3,165.00 $1,055.00 $1,300.43 $1,154.00
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IND 1 FA-02 APPION RECOVERY UNIT $0.00 NO BID $0.00

IND 1 FA-05 PORT. COMBUSTION ANALYZER $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00

IND 1 FA-06 WIRELESS PRINTER - COMB. ANALYZ $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00

IND 4 FA-07 LADDER - 6' DBLE ENTRY $0.00 NO BID $0.00

IND 6 FA-08 LADDER - 8' STEPLADDER $149.00 $149.00 $894.00 $149.00

IND 2 FA-09 LADDER - 12' STEPLADDER $249.00 $249.00 $498.00 $249.00

IND 1 FA-10 LADDER - 24' EXTENSION $229.00 $229.00 $229.00 $229.00

IND 2 FA-11 LADDER - 17' TELESCOPING MULTI. $0.00 NO BID $0.00

IND 2 FA-12 LADDER - 22' TELESCOPING MULTI. $0.00 NO BID $0.00

IND 1 FA-13 LIFT - GENIE MODEL AWP-40S $0.00 NO BID $0.00

IND 1 FA-15 SCAFFOLD - 20' STAIRWELL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

IND 2 FA-32 PANEL CART - HEAVY DUTY $459.00 $459.00 $918.00 $459.00

IND 2 FA-33 DOLLIE - DESK 600 LB. CAP. $157.79 $157.79 $315.58 $157.79

IND 4 FA-35 HAND TRUCK $139.00 $139.00 $556.00 $139.00

IND 1 FA-36 HAND TOOL SET $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00

IND 1 FA-37 TOOL CHEST $366.00 $366.00 $366.00 $366.00

IND 3 FA-38 CABINET - FLAMMABLE SAFETY $629.72 $629.72 $1,889.16 $629.72

IND 1 FA-39 CORDLESS TOOLS KIT $755.10 $755.10 $755.10 $755.10

IND 2 TEC-06 TECH. ED. SAFETY CABINET $0.00 NO BID $0.00

   

LAND 1 FA-40 MOWER - 36" DECK WALK-BEHIND $0.00 NO BID $0.00

LAND 4 FA-41 WEED WHACKER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

LAND 2 FA-42 LEAF BLOWER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

LAND 1 FA-43 MOWER - 72" DECK DIESEL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

   

MISC 1 COM-02 COM. PAPER DRILL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

MISC 2 FL-02
FLAG - STATE OF CONNECTICUT 3' X 5' FLAG W/ 
STAND

$0.00 NO BID $0.00

MISC 100 FL-03 FLAG - SM CLASSROOM FLAG $0.00 NO BID $0.00

MISC 1 GH-01 GREENHOUSE TABLES (LG) $0.00 NO BID $0.00

MISC 1 GH-02 GREENHOUSE TABLES (SM) $0.00 NO BID $0.00

MISC 2 REG-01 REGISTER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

MISC 2 WS-01 WATER STILL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

MISC 1 S-01 SAFE $738.00 $738.00 $738.00 $738.00

$0.00   
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WOOD 2 TEC-01 TECH. ED. AIR COMPRESSOR 120V $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-01 CONSTR. BAND SAW W/STAND $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-02 CONSTR. BELT/ DISC SANDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-04 CONSTR. DRILL PRESS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-06 CONSTR. JOINTER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-10 CONSTR. ROUTER/SHAPER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-11 CONSTR. SCROLLSAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-12 CONSTR. UNISAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 TLAB-01 TECH. BANDSAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 2 TLAB-02 TECH.  1" BELT/DISC SANDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 TLAB-03 TECH. 4" X 36" BELT/DISC SANDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 TLAB-04 TECH. BENCH SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 2 TLAB-05 TECH. DRILL PRESS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 TLAB-06 TECH. DUST COLLECTOR $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 TLAB-08 TECH. JOINTER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 TLAB-09 TECH. SCROLL SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-08 CONSTR. MITER SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 CON-09 CONSTR. RADIAL ARM SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 2 WB-01 WORK BENCH - CUSTODIAN $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 ME-04 TOOL STORAGE CAB. $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 COM-03 COM. WIRE FOLDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 SH-06 SHELVES - 24" DEEP HEAVY DUTY $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 9 SH-07 SHELVES - 18" WIRE SHELVING $145.00 $145.00 $1,305.00 $145.00 $166.18

WOOD 7 SH-08 SHELVES - 72' X 18" X 72" $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 21 SH-08-1 SHELVES - PARTICLE BOARD SHELVES $0.00 NO BID $0.00

WOOD 1 SH-09 SHELVES - 48" X 18" X 72" $0.00 NO BID $0.00

$0.00   

PAGE 5 OF 8



CONTROL LOWEST EXTENDED LOWEST ROVIC GRAINGER SUBURBAN MONITOR ALLSTON SUPPLY BENMAN NE MAINTENANCE OM WORKSPACE

Z-SPORTS 2 1 MAT 1 1" WRESTLING MAT $0.00 NO BID $0.00

Z-SPORTS 2 1 MAT 2 1.25" WRESTLING MAT $0.00 NO BID $0.00

$0.00   

Z-SPORTS 3 9 MAT 3 2" CHEERLEADING MATS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

$0.00   

Z-SPORTS 4 6 POOL 1 LAP COUNTER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

Z-SPORTS 4 6 POOL 2 STARTING BLOCK AND ACCESSORIES $0.00 NO BID $0.00

Z-SPORTS 4 1 POOL 3 TIMING SYSTEM AND ACCESSORIES $0.00 NO BID $0.00

Z-SPORTS 4 1 POOL 4 RECORD BOARD $0.00 NO BID $0.00

TOTAL HIGH SCHOOL $108,422.95
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VANCA 1 VQAS-01 TUB GROOMING $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VANCA 3 VQAS-02 CAGES, RABBIT $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VANCA 1 VQAS-04 KENNEL, LARGE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VANCA 1 VQAS-04-1 KENNEL, LARGE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VANCA 2 VQAS-04-2 KENNEL, LARGE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VANCA 1 VQAS-05 KENNEL, SMALL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VANCA 1 VQAS-05-1 KENNEL, SMALL $0.00 NO BID $0.00

   

VAP 1 VE114 MICROWAVE OVEN $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VAP 1 VE134 REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VAP 1 VE141 UPRIGHT FREEZER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VAP 1 VLA 02 WASHER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VAP 1 VLA 03 DRYER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

   

VAQUA 2 VQNR 01 FISH FARM $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VAQUA 1 VQNR 02 MINI FISH FARM $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VAQUA 6 VT 13 TABLE SMALL ST STEEL $910.66 $910.66 $5,463.96 $910.66

VAQUA 2 VT 14 TABLE ST STEEL $1,073.22 $1,073.22 $2,146.44 $1,073.22

   

VCUST 3 VBN 01 CUBE TRUCK $186.05 $186.05 $558.15 $186.05 $232.00 $199.00 $193.00

VCUST 3 VBN 01-1 LID CUBE TRUCK $103.78 $103.78 $311.34 $103.78 $108.00 $111.00 $108.10

VCUST 16 VGA 02 GARBAGE CAN 55 GAL $54.07 $54.07 $865.12 $54.07 $63.00 $58.00 $56.80

VCUST 16 VGA 02-1 GARBAGE CAN DOLLY $48.84 $48.84 $781.44 $48.84 $64.00 $52.46 $51.40

VCUST 6 VGA 05 GARBAGE CAN WE RECYCLE SMALL $3.95 $3.95 $23.70 $3.95 $4.75 $4.35 $5.20

VCUST 7 VGA 06 GARBAGE CAN WE RECYCLE MEDIUM $4.42 $4.42 $30.94 $4.42 $5.25 $4.60 $5.56

VCUST 2 VGA 07 GARBAGE CAN WE RECYCLE LARGE $33.26 $33.26 $66.52 $33.26 $39.50 $37.54 $35.32

   

VDISP 1 VDS 10 COUNTER DISPLAY CASE $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VDISP 2 VE 142 2 DOOR FLORIST COOLER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VDISP 2 VE 143 3 DOOR FLORIST COOLER $0.00 NO BID $0.00
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VWELD 14 VGA 04 GARBAGE CAN OILY RAGS $86.03 $86.03 $1,204.42 $86.03

VWELD 2 VQM 06 CURTAIN $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 50 VQM 06-1 CURTAIN HOOKS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 2 VQM 08 WELDING BOOTH $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 2 VQM 08-A WELDING BOOTH WITH FIRE BRICKS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 6 VQM 09 ARC WELDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 4 VQM 09-A TIG WELDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 5 VQM 10 MIG WELDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 1 VQM 12 PLASMA TORCH $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 1 VQM 12-1 PLASMA TORCH $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 1 VQM 15 PEDESTAL GRINDER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 2 VQM 17 HYDRAULIC HOIST $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 1 VQM 18 SOLVENT TANK $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWELD 1 VQM 33 CABINET WITH BINS $855.00 $855.00 $855.00 $855.00

   

VWOOD 16 VST 06 STOOL $55.00 $55.00 $880.00 $55.00 $114.00

VWOOD 1 VQM 11 PORTABLE BAND SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWOOD 1 VQM 13 DRILL PRESS $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWOOD 1 VQM 19 PLANER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWOOD 1 VQM 20 TABLE SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWOOD 1 VQM 21 RADIAL ARM SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWOOD 1 VQM 22 JOINER $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWOOD 1 VQM 31 MITER SAW $0.00 NO BID $0.00

VWOOD 9 VSH 07 SHELVES 18" WIRE $145.00 $145.00 $1,305.00 $145.00 $166.18

VWOOD 25 VSH 08 SHELVES 12 X 48 $157.66 $157.66 $3,941.50 $157.66

VWOOD 13 VSH 09 SHELVES 18 X 36 $145.38 $145.38 $1,889.94 $145.38

VWOOD 42 VSH 10 SHELVES 18 X 48 $176.02 $176.02 $7,392.84 $176.02

TOTAL VO AG $27,716.31
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